CITY OF ST. LOUIS
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
OFFICE OF THE SUPPLY COMMISSIONER

CAROL L SHEPARD, CPA FRANCIS G. SLAY 1200 MARKET ST RM 324

SUPPLY COMMISSIONER MAYOR ST LOUIS MO 63103
PHONE: 314-622-4580

FAX: 314-622-4141
ADDENDUM NO. 1

65016Q0613 - Diamond Grip Gloves
Bid Opening Date — September 10, 2015

To: All Bidders

From: Dotlyn Bedessie, Buyer

Date:  August 25, 2015

Re: 65016Q0613 — Diamond Grip Gloves Bid

This addendum shall be considered part of the Specifications for bid (except as noted otherwise) and is issued to change, amplify, or
delete from or otherwise explain these documents where provisions of this addendum differ from those of the original documents. This
addendum shall have precedence over the original documents and shall govern.

QI1: Can you supply us with the award pricing and previous vendor from the previous quote, or the current pricing and vendor?
Al: See Attachment A - Bid Tab for last year’s bid. The highlighted column displays the vendor(s) that the bid was/were
awarded to and the bid dollar amount.

Q2: How many delivery locations are there for the gloves?
A2: There is only one (1) delivery location.

Q3: How often are orders placed (thonthly, quarterly or other?) for the gloves?
A3: As needed, but approximately 2-3 times a year. Could be more based on crime trends.

Q4: When an order is placed, what is an approximate case order?
A4: About 12 cases at a time.

Q5: Line 1 states 90 cases; is this 90 cases of each size?
AS5: No just divide by 4. Each size is approximately 22.5 cases.

Q6: When we do the bid can we just pick one size glove to bid and note that all sizes from XS to XL are the same since we do not

know how many of each size the city will be purchasing?
AG6: Yes, if all sizes are the same, you may bid just one glove and make note that XS-XL are the same price.

Q7: For each of the three (3) gloves you request a quote for, is the material exam or non-exam and if it’s powdered or powder free?
A7: All gloves are powdered free, unless specified, they are latex.
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All bidders must attach this form to the original Bid/Quote Form. This completed form will serve as acknowledgement that this
information has been received.

ADDENDUM RECEIVED AND ACKNOWLEDGE

Name of Firm

i{ep;,se_ntat_ive

Signature - Date



RFQ 65015Q0615, LATEX/NITRILE GLOVES

ATTACHMENT A

A. DAIGGER FISHER SCIENTFC MIDSCI MIDWEST MED. MAGID GLOVE
DESCRIPTION QTY | UOM UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

Latex Exam

Gloves - Powder

Free

Extra Smali 20 Case | NoBid $ - $ 10859 § 2171.80|$% 7600 § 1,520.00 NoBid § - No Bid $ -
Small 20 Case No Bid § $ 10859 § 217180 % 7600 § 1,520.00 No Bid § - No Bid $

Medium 25 Case No Bid § - $ 10859 § 271475|% 7600 § 1,900.00 NoBid § - NoBid $

Large 25 Case | NoBid § $ 10859 § 271475|% 7600 § 1,900.00 No Bid §$ - No Bid $ -
SUBTOTAL $ - $ 9,773.10 $ 6,840.00 $ - $ -
Latex Gloves -

Powder Free

Small 10 Case 14908 § 149080 | % 11430 § 1,143.00 | $ 116.00 $ 1,160.00 | $ 10480 $ 1,048.00 | $11420 § 1,142.00
Medium 10 Case 149.08 3 1,49080 | § 11430 $ 1,143.00 | $ 116.00 § 1,160.00 | $ 10480 $ 1,04800 | $11420 § 1,142 00
Large 10 Case 149.08 § 149080 | § 11430 § 1,143,001 $ 116.00 $ 1,160.00 | $ 10480 $ 1,048.00 | $11420 § 1,142.00
X-Large 10 Case 14908 $ 149080 | § 11430 § 1,143.00 | $ 116.00 § 1,160.00 | $ 10480 $ 1,04800 | $11420 § 1.142,00
SUBTOTAL $ 5,963.20 $ 4,572.00 $ 4,640.00 $ 4,192.00 $ 4,568.00
Latex GIovesP-

Powder Free

Small 10 Case 12162 % 121620 |'S 7911 ' § 79110 | & 106.00 $ 1,06000 | $ 8414 % 84140 | % 9770 % 977.00
Medium 15 Case | 12162 § 182430 | & 7911 § 1,186.65 | $ 106.00 § 159000 | % 8414 § 126210 % 97.70 $ 1,465.50
Large 15 Case 12162 § 1,824.30 |'S" 78411 § 1,186.65| $ 10600 $§ 159000|% 8414 § 1,262.10| $ 9770 § 1,465.50
SUBTOTAL $ 4,864,80 $ 3,164.40 $ 4,240.00 $ 3,365.60 $ 3,908.00
Gloves - Powder

Free

Small 10 Case No Bid § $ 9115 § 91150 | $ 6300 $ 630.00 NoBid $ = NoBid $

Medium 10 Case NoBid $ - $ 9115 § 91150 |$ 6300 $ 630 00 NoBid $ No Bid $

Large 10 Case NoBid $ - $ 9115 §$ 911650 | $ 63.00 $ 630.00 NoBid % = NoBid $

X-lLarge 10 Case | NoBid $ = $ 9115 § 91150 | § 6300 $ 630,00 NoBid $ - NoBid %
|SUBTOTAL $ - § 3,646.00 $ 2,520.00 $ - $ -
FREIGHT 1 Each $ 250.00 § - $ - $ - Included $ -

ﬁ= —
TOTAL $  11,078.00 $  21,155.50 $ 18,240.00 $ 7,557.60 $ 8,476.00
DELIVERY 20 Days 7-10 Days 1-3 Days 1-3 Days
'EMPIRE MEDICL BOUND TREE PERF. SAFETY FIRST STOP FIRST
DESCRIPTION QTY | uom | UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

Latex Exam

Gloves - Powder

Free

Exlra Small 20 Case | 5500 8 1.100.00 NoBid $ - § 4799 § 959.78 | $ 61.40 § 1,228.00

Small 20 Case 5500 § 1.1{'){1_.&0.: NoBid § - § 4799 § 959.78 | § 6140 $ 1,228.00

|Medium 25 Case 5500 % 137500 NoBid $ - $ 4799 § 119973 | ¢ 6140 $ 1,535.00

Large 25 | case | 5500 §  1.37500] NoBid $ - |s 4799 5 1199.73| 3 6140 1,535.00

SUBTOTAL $ 4,950.00 $ - $ 4,319.01 $ 5,626.00

I s

Latex Glovesp- EE

Powder Free .

Small 10 | Case | NoBid § - |8 $ 49,99 § 499.89 | $107.90 % 1,079.00

[Medium 10 Case No Bid § ﬁ S 49,99 § 499.89 | $ 10790 § 1,079.00

Large 10 Case No Bid & - 3 79,50 '§ 5499 § 54989 | $ 107.90 § 1,079.00

X-Large 10 Case No Bid § - i$ 79_50 § 5499 $ 54989 | $ 10790 § 1,079.00

ISUBTOTAL $ - ] 3,180.00 $ 2,099.56 $ 4,316.00

Diamond Grip Plus

Latex Gloves -

Powder Free

Small 10 Case No Bid & - $ 8320 § 832008 4999 § 49989 ] % 8290 $ 829.00

Medium 15 Case No Bid & $ 8320 $ 1248008 4999 §$ 74984 | § 8290 $ 1.243.50

Large 15 Case | NoBid $ - $ 8320 $ 124800)% 5499 § 82484 1% 8290 § 1,243.50

|suBTOTAL $ - $ 3,328.00 $ 2,074.56 s 3,316.00

Gloves - Powder

Free

Small 10 | Case | 5200 % 52000 | NoBid $ - |3 4799 s 47989 | 4840 & 451.00

|Medium 10 | Case 5200 § 520.00 NoBid $ - |$ 4799 3 47989 4510 § 451,00

Large 10 | case | 5200 % 520.00 No Bid $ $ 4999 $ 49989 4510 § 45100

X-Large 10 | case | 5200 s 52000| NoBid § - |s 4999 s 40089 | 4510 % 451,00

|SUBTOTAL $ 2,080.00 $ - 5 1,959.56 $ 1,804.00

FREIGHT 1 Each Incl  § Included $ - Included $ $ 1500 § 15.00

TOTAL $ 7,030.00 $ 6,508,00 $ 10,452.69 $ 14,977.00

DELIVERY 7 Days 2-3 Days 1-5 Days 30 Days




